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Bob Dylan’s 1975 album Blood On The Tracks is considered by many to be his masterpiece. Routinely
labelled “Dylan’s Divorce Album,” it is also widely taken as a painfully autobiographical account of the
deterioration of his first marriage: “the greatest break-up record of all time.” But the reality behind the
making of the record is far more complex, and the result of a struggle that saw Dylan attempting to
rediscover his own art on his own terms, after a long period away from the rock and roll fray, during which,
for many, he seemed to turn his back on the implications of his own 1960s work. How difficult a struggle
that turned out to be is borne witness by the fact that, just days before Blood On The Tracks was due to be
released, Dylan suddenly decided to halt the presses, scrap half the tracks, and return to the studio to quickly
record them again. In Back In The Rain, Doc Pasquale vividly positions Blood On The Tracks not simply in
the context of Dylan’s marriage, but his long “retreat” from rock and roll and public life: the big silence that
lasted from his 1966 motorcycle crash, to his return to touring in 1974. Peeling back the layers in an
extensive track-by-track analysis, he also examines the differences between the version of Blood On The
Tracks that Dylan originally recorded and the version that he eventually released, and what those differences
reveal about this album that won't let go.
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From reader reviews:

Yolanda Osuna:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want sense happy read one having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Back In
The Rain: The Making, Unmaking & Remaking of Bob Dylan's Blood On The Tracks is kind of reserve
which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Bobby Miller:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, or even playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can
spent 24 hours a day to reading a reserve. The book Back In The Rain: The Making, Unmaking & Remaking
of Bob Dylan's Blood On The Tracks it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart
phone. The price is not to fund but this book features high quality.

Sarah Davis:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get great
deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
are there when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular book
you have read is usually Back In The Rain: The Making, Unmaking & Remaking of Bob Dylan's Blood On
The Tracks.

Evelyn Roberts:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The Back In The Rain:
The Making, Unmaking & Remaking of Bob Dylan's Blood On The Tracks provide you with a new



experience in looking at a book.
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