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A runaway international bestseller and winner of Spain’s top literary prize, Little Indiscretions is part
ingeniously entertaining whodunit and part sparkling social satire.

Business is slow for Nestor Chaffino, pastry chef to the rich and famous, until he’s invited to cater a party in
a villa on the Costa del Sol. When Nestor is found frozen to death in a walk-in freezer with a notebook in his
hand, the party guests gathered that evening are the natural suspects. But who could have it in for a harmless
cook?

The answer, it turns out, is just about everyone who happens to be staying in the house. Nestor, while quietly
stirring his sauces and whisking his egg whites, had decided to publish a compendium of gastronomic secrets
that revealed, along with the culinary tricks of his trade, more than a few damning details of the hosts’ and
houseguests’ private lives. To what lengths would they go to ensure that Nestor maintained a more
permanent sense of discretion?

Not since Nick and Nora Charles’s last cocktail party has such a merry band of mischief makers convened in
one place. Little Indiscretions marks the discovery of a phenomenal writer with tremendous flair. It’s a
gourmet treat readers will pounce on.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Tomczak:

The book Little Indiscretions: A Delectable Mystery give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time.
You should use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book Little
Indiscretions: A Delectable Mystery being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal
capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You may know everything if you like available
and read a book Little Indiscretions: A Delectable Mystery. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Corrine Steinke:

What do you about book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question since just
their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct. Because
start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Little Indiscretions: A Delectable Mystery to
read.

Scott Settle:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer might be Little Indiscretions: A Delectable Mystery why because
the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.

Candace Edwards:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Little Indiscretions: A
Delectable Mystery which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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