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The JT LeRoy scandal is a story of our times. In January 2006, the New York Times unmasked Savannah
Knoop as the face of the mysterious author JT LeRoy. A media frenzy ensued as JT’s fans, mentors, and
readers came to terms with the fact that the gay-male-ex-truck-stop-prostitute-turned literary-wunderkind
was really a girl from San Francisco, whose sister-in-law wrote the books.
Girl Boy Girl is the story of how Savannah Knoop led this bizarre double life for six years, trading a
precarious existence as a college dropout for a life in which she was embraced by celebrities and
artists—Carrie Fisher, Courtney Love, Mary Ellen Mark, Winona Ryder, Asia Argento, Sharon Olds, Gus
Van Sant, Mike Pitt, Calvin Klein, and Shirley Manson, to name a few—and traveled the world. Telling her
side of the story for the first time, Savannah reveals how being perceived as a boy gave her a sense of
confidence and entitlement she never had before. Her love affair with Asia Argento is particularly
wrenching, as they embark on an intimate relationship that causes more alienation than closeness.
As Savannah and Laura struggle over control of the JT character, Savannah realizes the limits of the game - -
and inadvertently finds herself through the adventure of being someone else.
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From reader reviews:

Leticia Simmons:

This book untitled Girl Boy Girl: How I Became JT Leroy to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
kind of book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there
is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Raymond Roth:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare time
coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It
can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is usually Girl Boy
Girl: How I Became JT Leroy.

Fern Rodriquez:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find e-book that need more time to be go
through. Girl Boy Girl: How I Became JT Leroy can be your answer given it can be read by an individual
who have those short extra time problems.

William Stewart:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half portions of the book. You can choose the actual book Girl Boy Girl: How I Became JT Leroy to
make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading skill is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about book and
studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the e-book
Girl Boy Girl: How I Became JT Leroy can to be your brand new friend when you're sense alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of that time.
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