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One of the law's most important and far-reaching roles is to govern family life and family members. Family
law decides who counts as kin, how family relationships are created and dissolved, and what legal rights and
responsibilities come with marriage, parenthood, sibling ties, and other family bonds. Yet despite its
significance, the field remains remarkably understudied and poorly understood both within and outside the
legal community.

Family Law Reimagined is the first book to evaluate the canonical narratives, examples, and ideas that legal
decisionmakers repeatedly invoke to explain family law and its governing principles. These stories contend
that family law is exclusively local, that it repudiates market principles, that it has eradicated the imprint of
common law doctrines which subordinated married women, that it is dominated by contract rules permitting
individuals to structure their relationships as they choose, and that it consistently prioritizes children's
interests over parents' rights. In this book, Jill Elaine Hasday reveals how family law's canon misdescribes
the reality of family law, misdirects attention away from the actual problems that family law confronts, and
misshapes the policies that legal authorities pursue. She demonstrates how much of the "common sense" that
decisionmakers expound about family law actually makes little sense.

Family Law Reimagined uncovers and critiques the family law canon and outlines a path to reform.
Challenging conventional answers and asking questions that judges and lawmakers routinely overlook, it
calls on us to reimagine family law.
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From reader reviews:

Nathaniel Thomas:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Family Law Reimagined. Try to make book Family Law Reimagined as
your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you sense alone and beside that course
make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

Meredith Butler:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Family Law Reimagined book
as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Della Ferguson:

The particular book Family Law Reimagined will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading any
book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study, this book very
acceptable to you. The book Family Law Reimagined is much recommended to you you just read. You can
also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Donna Feuerstein:

The reason? Because this Family Law Reimagined is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret this inside. Reading this book beside it was
fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains than the
other book include such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking way. So , still want to
hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.
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