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WELCOME TO SPOOKSVILLE  What if you knew what a friend, or a lover, or a client was thinking?
Would it empower you or drive you crazy? For Dillon Bradford, hearing people’s thoughts has proved
monumentally profitable. Dillon is a cool hunter and has leveraged his telepathic ability into Cool Brain, one
of Dallas’ largest and most successful brand design agencies. Dillon isn’t the only one wielding this
remarkable gift, however. Other telepaths are living large in Big D, and Dillon has brought them together for
fun and profit.

But Dillon’s tony life begins to unravel when an intriguing woman joins his special group. Debra Lao works
for Ewing Pharmaceuticals, one of CoolBrain’s largest accounts. At first, she seems the perfect addition, but
after a few drinks, Dillon discovers Lao has a unique sexual twist on their telepathic gift. Inexorably drawn
to this exotic Asian beauty, Dillon soon finds his world turned inside out. Blackouts. Seizures. Mysterious
marks at the base of his skull. What is happening to Dillon Bradford? Is Debra Lao what she seems? Is his
life what it seems?

Dallas’ most eligible bachelor is about to be thrust into the dangerous and seedy world of international arms
trade and black operations, and there’s seemingly nothing he can do to stop it, because Dillon Bradford’s gift
isn’t like his telepathic friends’ and rival forces scattered around the globe will do whatever it takes to
harness his extraordinary power.

From two-time Independent Publishers Book Award winner, Paul Black, comes a thriller that is sure to win
with critics and audiences. Part spy novel, part love story, part paranormal thriller, Cool Brain has it all.
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From reader reviews:

Antoinette Hogg:

Here thing why this kind of Cool Brain are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading through a
book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as tasty as food or not.
Cool Brain giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any book out there but
there is no publication that similar with Cool Brain. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your
personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you.
You can easily bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Cool Brain in e-book can be your option.

William Lyons:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how
the figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Cool
Brain, you may tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can
inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

John Harris:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Cool
Brain will give you new experience in looking at a book.

Oliver Lyle:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this book. This Cool Brain is simple to create you can
read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring
often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the
actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.
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