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"You have kept your promise, for you are righteous." —Nehemiah 9:8

The book of Nehemiah powerfully illustrates God's faithfulness as it chronicles Israel's return from exile. In
this collection of biblical expositions, nine prominent Bible teachers lead readers on a gospel-centered survey
of this Old Testament book, connecting the story of Nehemiah to God's overarching story of redemption.
Chapters include:

Kathy Keller - Taking Action in Light of God's Word (Nehemiah 1-2)

Tim Keller - Laboring for a God Who Fights for Us (Nehemiah 3-4)

Paige Brown - Fearing God in a Fallen World (Nehemiah 5-6)

Nancy Guthrie - Coming Together around God's Word (Nehemiah 7-8)

John Piper - Responding to God according to His Word (Nehemiah 9-10)

Carrie Sandom, Jenny Salt, & Kathleen Nielson - Celebrating! A Moment of Joy in Jerusalem (Nehemiah
11-12)

D. A. Carson - Leaning Forward in the Dark: A Failed Reformation (Nehemiah 13)
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From reader reviews:

Karena Figueroa:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled God's Word, Our Story: Learning from the Book of Nehemiah
(The Gospel Coalition). Try to make book God's Word, Our Story: Learning from the Book of Nehemiah
(The Gospel Coalition) as your buddy. It means that it can to get your friend when you feel alone and beside
that course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you
much more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new experience in
addition to knowledge with this book.

Sam Stenger:

This God's Word, Our Story: Learning from the Book of Nehemiah (The Gospel Coalition) are generally
reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The reason of this God's Word, Our
Story: Learning from the Book of Nehemiah (The Gospel Coalition) can be among the great books you must
have will be giving you more than just simple examining food but feed anyone with information that might
be will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere
and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed types. Beside that this God's Word, Our Story:
Learning from the Book of Nehemiah (The Gospel Coalition) forcing you to have an enormous of experience
for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day task.
So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Josette Leonard:

You may spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This God's Word, Our Story: Learning from
the Book of Nehemiah (The Gospel Coalition) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach,
train as well as soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-
book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. And so there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Nancy Byrom:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous books that
can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually God's Word, Our Story: Learning from the
Book of Nehemiah (The Gospel Coalition).
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