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'An important literary achievement.' - Library Journal

'Colin Wilson has a narrative style that can make the pursuit of any idea seem like exciting detective work.' -
The Times

'Colin Wilson's best novel to date.' - The Spectator

Howard Lester, a young scientist, becomes obsessed with the problem of death and begins a series of
unconventional experiments aimed at increasing human longevity. In the course of their research, Lester and
his friend Sir Henry Littleway make a startling discovery: a simple and harmless operation on the brain's
prefrontal cortex results in vastly expanded consciousness and mental powers. After undergoing the
procedure themselves, Lester and Littleway develop remarkable abilities, including 'time vision', a means of
seeing backwards into time. They begin by looking at the relatively recent past-the eighteenth century and
Shakespeare's England. But they soon find they can see much further back, to the days of Stonehenge and the
Mayans, and even earlier. . . . But as they get closer to uncovering the beginnings of human existence, they
make a terrifying discovery: something ancient and immensely powerful, long asleep, has been awakened by
their activities, and is determined to stop them at all costs. . . .

In The Strength to Dream (1962), Colin Wilson had criticized the works of H.P. Lovecraft, the American
writer of weird tales, which led to Lovecraft's publisher August Derleth daring Wilson to write one better.
This novel, The Philosopher's Stone (1969), was the result, a fascinating blend of science fiction, horror, and
philosophy, told within the framework of Lovecraft's mythos. This edition is newly typeset from the first
British edition and features a new introduction by Wilson scholar and bibliographer Colin Stanley.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Jones:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book The Philosopher's Stone. You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about how is important the book The
Philosopher's Stone. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely
right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can
be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or
perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go
to the library. Let's study.

Phillip Patten:

The Philosopher's Stone can be one of your nice books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight
away because this e-book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in words, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort that
will put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Philosopher's Stone but doesn't forget the main
place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be
certainly one of it. This great information can drawn you into brand new stage of crucial thinking.

Deborah Oneal:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find publication that need
more time to be read. The Philosopher's Stone can be your answer because it can be read by anyone who
have those short free time problems.

Louella Rape:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to
you is The Philosopher's Stone this guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now.
That book was represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it
is easy to understand. The actual writer made some research when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why
this book acceptable all of you.
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