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The story that you have asked me to tell you does not begin with the pitiful ugliness of Lloyd’s death. It
begins on a long-ago day in August when the sun seared my blistered face and I was nine years old and my
father and mother sold me to a strange man.

Memory, the narrator of Petina Gappah’s The Book of Memory, is an albino woman languishing in Chikurubi
Maximum Security Prison in Harare, Zimbabwe, after being sentenced for murder. As part of her appeal, her
lawyer insists that she write down what happened as she remembers it. The death penalty is a mandatory
sentence for murder, and Memory is, both literally and metaphorically, writing for her life. As her story
unfolds, Memory reveals that she has been tried and convicted for the murder of Lloyd Hendricks, her
adopted father. But who was Lloyd Hendricks? Why does Memory feel no remorse for his death? And did
everything happen exactly as she remembers?

Moving between the townships of the poor and the suburbs of the rich, and between past and present, the
2009 Guardian First Book Award–winning writer Petina Gappah weaves a compelling tale of love,
obsession, the relentlessness of fate, and the treachery of memory.
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Travis:

Inside other case, little people like to read book The Book of Memory: A Novel. You can choose the best
book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book The Book of
Memory: A Novel. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by just a book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this
era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it
when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's go through.

John Frank:

The publication untitled The Book of Memory: A Novel is the publication that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you. The language that creator
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of investigation when
write the book, to ensure the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can
get the e-book of The Book of Memory: A Novel from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Rodolfo Rodgers:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer can be The Book of Memory: A Novel why because the amazing cover that
make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Terrie Newlin:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Book of Memory: A Novel was multi-
colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The Book of Memory: A Novel has many
kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you
can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you
bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like
reading that.
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