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The first novel Patrick O'Brian ever wrote about the sea, a precursor to the acclaimed
Aubrey/Maturin series.

In the year 1740, Commodore (later Admiral) George Anson embarked on a voyage that would become one
of the most famous exploits in British naval history. Sailing through poorly charted waters, Anson and his
men encountered disaster, disease, and astonishing success. They circumnavigated the globe and seized a
nearly incalcuable sum of Spanish gold and silver, but only one of the five ships survived.

This is the background to the first novel Patrick O'Brian ever wrote about the sea, a precursor to the
acclaimed Aubrey/Maturin series that shares the excitement and rich humor of those books. The protagonist
is Peter Palafox, son of a poor Irish parson, who signs on as a midshipman, never before having seen a ship.
Together with his lifelong friend Sean, Peter sets out to seek his fortune, embarking upon a journey of
danger, disappointment, foreign lands, and excitement.

Here is a tale certain to please not only admirers of O'Brian's work but also any reader with an adventurous
soul.
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From reader reviews:

Richard McCain:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us that
book is very important for people. The book The Golden Ocean has been making you to know about other
know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The guide The
Golden Ocean is not only giving you much more new information but also being your friend when you really
feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with
all the book The Golden Ocean. You never experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

Nancy Brown:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition info. Even you love The Golden Ocean, it is possible to enjoy both. It is great
combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind
hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Delaine Valencia:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying The Golden Ocean that
give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react in the direction of
the world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you
may pick The Golden Ocean become your personal starter.

Dianne Roy:

This The Golden Ocean is fresh way for you who has attention to look for some information since it relief
your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having tiny amount of digest in reading this The Golden Ocean can be the light food for you because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books acquire itself in the
form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in reserve form
make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss it!
Just read this e-book kind for your better life and also knowledge.
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