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This set includes all four books of the Heroines Behind the Lines Series: Wedded to War, Widow of
Gettysburg, Yankee in Atlanta, and Spy of Richmond.  The Heroines Behind the Lines Series highlights the
crucial contributions made by women during the Civil War.

In Wedded to War, Charlotte chooses a life of service over privilege, just as her childhood friend had done
when he became a military doctor. She soon discovers that she’s combatting more than just the rebellion by
becoming a nurse. Will the two men who love her simply stand by and watch as she fights her own battles?
Or will their desire for her wage war on her desire to serve God?

In Widow of Gettysburg, the farm of Union widow Liberty Holloway is disfigured into a Confederate field
hospital, bringing her face to face with unspeakable suffering—and a Confederate scout who awakens her
long dormant heart. Will Liberty be defined by the tragedy in her life, or will she find a way to triumph over
it?

In Yankee in Atlanta, soldier Caitlin McKae wakes up in Atlanta after being wounded in battle. The Georgian
doctor who treated her believed Caitlin's only secret was that she had been fighting for the Confederacy
disguised as a man. To avoid arrest or worse, Caitlin hides her true identity and makes a new life for herself
in Atlanta. When Sherman’s troops edge closer to Atlanta, Caitlin tries to escape north, but is arrested on
charges of being a spy. Will honor dictate that Caitlin follow the rules, or love demand that she break them?

In Spy of Richmond, Union loyalist Sophie Kent attempts to end the war from within the Confederate capital,
but she can’t do it alone. As Sophie’s spy network grows, she walks a tightrope of deception, using her
father’s position as newspaper editor and a suitor’s position in the ordnance bureau. When her espionage
endangers the people she loves, she's forced to make a life-and-death gamble.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

This Heroines Behind the Lines Series (Set of 4 books) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after
that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside
this guide incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you
will get. This Heroines Behind the Lines Series (Set of 4 books) without we realize teach the one who
looking at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Heroines Behind the Lines
Series (Set of 4 books) can bring if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Heroines Behind the Lines Series (Set of 4
books) having great arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Russell Carson:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Heroines Behind the Lines Series (Set of
4 books) as the daily resource information.

Mike Hodges:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get great deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time,
we will say absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time,
often the book you have read is definitely Heroines Behind the Lines Series (Set of 4 books).

Jeanette Williams:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Heroines Behind the Lines
Series (Set of 4 books), you could enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it?
What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh
come on its referred to as reading friends.
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