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In Reading Backwards Richard B. Hays maps the shocking ways the four Gospel writers interpreted Israel's
Scripture to craft their literary witnesses to the Church's one Christ. The Gospels' scriptural imagination
discovered inside the long tradition of a resilient Jewish monotheism a novel and revolutionary Christology.

Modernity's incredulity toward the Christian faith partly rests upon the characterization of early Christian
preaching as a tendentious misreading of the Hebrew Scriptures. Christianity, modernity claims, twisted the
Bible they inherited to fit its message about a mythological divine Savior. The Gospels, for many modern
critics, are thus more about Christian doctrine in the second and third century than they are about Jesus in the
first.

Such Christian "misreadings" are not late or politically motivated developments within Christian thought. As
Hays demonstrates, the claim that the events of Jesus' life, death, and resurrection took place "according to
the Scriptures" stands at the very heart of the New Testament's earliest message. All four canonical Gospels
declare that the Torah and the Prophets and the Psalms mysteriously prefigure Jesus. The author of the
Fourth Gospel puts the claim succinctly: "If you believed Moses, you would believe me, for he wrote about
me" (John 5:46).

Hays thus traces thereading strategies the Gospel writers employ to "read backwards" and to discover how
the Old Testament figuratively discloses the astonishing paradoxical truth about Jesus' identity. Attention to
Jewish and Old Testament roots of the Gospel narratives reveals that each of the four Evangelists, in their
diverse portrayals, identify Jesus as the embodiment of the God of Israel. Hays also explores the
hermeneutical challenges posed by attempting to follow the Evangelists as readers of Israel's Scripture?can
the Evangelists teach us to read backwards along with them and to discern the same mystery they discovered
in Israel's story?

In Reading Backwards Hays demonstrates that it was Israel's Scripture itself that taught the Gospel writers
how to understand Jesus as the embodied presence of God, that this conversion of imagination occurred early
in the development of Christian theology, and that the Gospel writers' revisionary figural readings of their
Bible stand at the very center of Christianity.
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From reader reviews:

Annie Boyd:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled
Reading Backwards: Figural Christology and the Fourfold Gospel Witness? Maybe it is to be best activity
for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before.
Do you agree with it is opinion or you have different opinion?

Sheila Cyr:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great and important the book Reading Backwards: Figural Christology and the
Fourfold Gospel Witness. All type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Nancy Deanda:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you go
through a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us
novel, comics, and soon. The Reading Backwards: Figural Christology and the Fourfold Gospel Witness will
give you a new experience in examining a book.

Patrice Eubanks:

Beside this kind of Reading Backwards: Figural Christology and the Fourfold Gospel Witness in your phone,
it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you
are going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an aged people
live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Reading Backwards: Figural Christology and the Fourfold
Gospel Witness because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you at times have book
but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this with your
hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss that? Find this book and read it from now!
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