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DO YOU WANT TO GET WELL?

The power to heal—physically, mentally, emotionally, spiritually—is in God’s hands. But the choice to be
healed is yours. Everyone, at some level, needs healing. You may have prayed for healing many times, for
many years. Perhaps you have lived with your brokenness so long that you have become accustomed to it.
Maybe you wonder just when God is going to take all the hurt away.

He can. But you also must choose to let the hurt go and let the healing begin.

In this special edition of Healing Is a Choice, author Stephen Arterburn offers a unique combination of book
and workbook, outlining ten choices crucial to receiving healing. Embracing these choices means rejecting
the lies we often tell ourselves. These are not hoops God requires you to jump through to earn your miracle;
they form, instead, the journey He desires for you. He can—and will—walk with you. But you must put
one foot in front of the other and choose to let the hurt go and let the healing begin.

“His Word affirms that God wants us to experience His healing, but many times we make choices that stand
in the way. Healing Is a Choice is a helpful resource that lays out the path of healing God’s way.”

— JACK HAYFORD Founding pastor, The Church on the Way, Van Nuys, CA

“When we look back at the past turns and twists in the pathways of our lives, we can see significant choices
we made, which helped create the lives we have now. Stephen Arterburn has provided us with a guide for
making the right decisions today to provide a redemptive path for tomorrow.”

—JOHN TOWNSEND Coauthor of the bestsellerBoundaries

“I am asking you to give up your life as you know it so that you can fi nd the life God has for you. Take hold
of your future today and make the choices that will lead to your healing.”

—STEPHEN ARTERBURN

“He heals the brokenhearted and binds up their wounds."

—Psalm 147:3
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Garrison:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know what one you should start with. This Healing Is a Choice: 10 Decisions That
Will Transform Your Life and 10 Lies That Can Prevent You From Making Them is our recommendation to
make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Samuel Ware:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel happy
read one having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Healing Is a Choice: 10
Decisions That Will Transform Your Life and 10 Lies That Can Prevent You From Making Them is kind of
publication which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Maurice Conner:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read some
sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day
to reading a guide. The book Healing Is a Choice: 10 Decisions That Will Transform Your Life and 10 Lies
That Can Prevent You From Making Them it is very good to read. There are a lot of people who
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough
space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Rigoberto Stansell:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can
know everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year had been exactly added. This guide Healing Is a Choice: 10 Decisions That Will Transform Your Life
and 10 Lies That Can Prevent You From Making Them was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to
add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they
reading a book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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