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"We are compelled to both escape from and find meaning in the emptiness stirring inside of us.
Unfortunately, without a method to channel these frustrations, we will not find an escape."
 
Have you ever asked yourself the famous question, "What is the meaning of my life?" Maybe you sensed the
world as it appears in your senses is lacking something. A spiritual world that is blind to most people awaits
you. 
 
The Egotist's author, Jesse Bogner, felt the same need to search for something beyond what he could see with
his own eyes. His earth-shattering debut tracks his development from a hedonistic New Yorker whose only
solace from suffering comes in the form of aesthetic pursuits, drugs and alcohol to a Kabbalist on a path to
find the meaning of life. Holding a mirror to the nature of the world and to his own life, Bogner illuminates
the world in a state of crisis in need of redemption. This book offers a glimpse into the misunderstood world
of Kabbalah and how the collective plea of Kabbalists has the power to correct the egos of individuals and
the world at large.
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From reader reviews:

Dick McAlister:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled The Egotist. Try to make the book The Egotist as your buddy. It means that
it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than ever
before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more confidence because you can
know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience and knowledge with this book.

John Enriquez:

Often the book The Egotist will bring you to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author
style to clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book you just read, this book very ideal to
you. The book The Egotist is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Miguel Willis:

The publication untitled The Egotist is the e-book that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality
of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are
easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that
they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of The Egotist from the
publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Amado Spieker:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This The Egotist is simple to deliver
you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to
bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can
save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.
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