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The Scent of Ginger is a crime thriller that takes place in present day Honolulu. James Spencer is a brilliant
and well-known neurosurgeon living with a terminal illness. He has devoted his career to helping soldiers
with traumatic brain injuries (TBI) and PTSD, but as his disease progressed, he was forced to drop his
practice. However, he continued to experiment in the field of advanced neuro-technology, developing
powerful brain implants that not only treat the symptoms, but also have the potential to give him a new
perspective on the world. When his best friend from high school, Lou Costelilia, returns from Afghanistan
with TBI and severe PTSD, James jumps at the chance to utilize his experimental brain implants and
reconstruct his friend. The implants cure Lou, and at the same time allow Spencer to communicate directly
with Costelilia and fully experience the world—through his friend's brain. The men are able to connect with
the secret implants, allowing Doctor Spencer to see, hear, smell, touch and taste the world like never before.
Together they decide to use their unique partnership to promote justice and make the islands safer. As
freelance consultants, they take on cold cases for the Honolulu Police Department. Spencer has been working
on the notorious Mongoose case privately for years—evidence indicates that the infamous burglar that only
victimizes the wealthiest and most powerful families in Hawaii, is someone he knows. He keeps his thoughts
about the Mongoose to himself until Lou is abducted during a routine stakeout and they receive a series of
threatening messages. It's time to let Costelilia in on his suspicions.
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From reader reviews:

Owen Ray:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great and also important the book The Scent of Ginger. All type of book are
you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Anna Snyder:

This The Scent of Ginger are generally reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason
of this The Scent of Ginger can be on the list of great books you must have is definitely giving you more
than just simple reading through food but feed anyone with information that probably will shock your
previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Scent of Ginger giving you an enormous of
experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day
action. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Nicol Thomas:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to consider
look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Scent of Ginger can be excellent book to read. May be it may
be best activity to you.

Carrie Mathis:

Precisely why? Because this The Scent of Ginger is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting
for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it was
fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get
such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold up having
that book? If I have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.
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