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In 1990 Nicola Perry, former tea lady at the London Stock Exchange, started living her dream. She found a
storefront and opened Tea & Sympathy, an authentic amalgamation of English tea shop, mum's kitchen, and
working man's café right in the heart of New York. Anita Naughton was one of her first waitresses, and from
day one she kept an anecdotal record of the place, encapsulating the charm, flavor, and enigmatic patrons
that are the atmosphere of the restaurant.

Together they have created a colorful biography spanning the first decade of this landmark eatery: from the
early days, when they kept their meager profits in a teapot, to nowadays, when they keep celebrities (British,
American, or otherwise) waiting for a table along with everyone else. Complete with sixty recipes and
photographs of food and popular visitors, this is a quintessential taste of England ready to take home.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Dabney:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book
allowed Tea and Sympathy? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend
your time using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you
have some other opinion?

Wayne Hause:

The book Tea and Sympathy can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave a very important thing like a book Tea and Sympathy? Wide variety you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim this book can give many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right
now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you can give for each other; it
is possible to share all of these. Book Tea and Sympathy has simple shape however, you know: it has great
and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Rosa Tarpley:

Tea and Sympathy can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight
away because this publication has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in words, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word
into joy arrangement in writing Tea and Sympathy but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great
information may drawn you into new stage of crucial pondering.

Cleveland Bolton:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This particular Tea and Sympathy can give you a lot of
good friends because by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't and make you more
like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you
information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than additional make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have Tea and Sympathy.
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