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The second edition of this book is out! Please look for the second edition (updated and improved)! This is the
first edition.

About “Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students” This series provides practice materials and short
theory reminders for students who aim to excel at problem solving. Material is introduced in a structured
manner: each new concept is followed by a problem set that explores the content in detail. Each book ends
with a problem set that reviews both concepts presented in the current volume and related topics from
previous volumes. The series forms a learning continuum that explores strategies specific to competitive
mathematics in depth and breadth. Full solutions explain both reasoning and execution. Often, several
solutions are contrasted. The problem selection emphasizes comprehension, critical thinking, observation,
and avoiding repetitive and mechanical procedures. Ready to participate in a math competition such as
MOEMS, Math Kangaroo in USA, or Noetic Math? This series will open the doors to consistent
performance.

About Level 1 This level of the series is designed for students who know addition and subtraction with
multi-digit numbers as well as simple multiplications of one-digit numbers. Some of the problems, however,
involve advanced concepts and may be useful for older students.

About “Volume 3 - Operations” This workbook focuses on developing rapid and accurate computational
skills as well as a solid number sense. Since most contests do not allow calculators, it is important to learn
how to execute strings of operations efficiently. Even more important, however, is a well grounded number
sense. This volume emphasizes flexibility in using the order of operations and creativity in designing the
optimal solution path. Ultimately, the idea is to build a sense of ‘wizardry’ in handling numbers. Many
exercises are mapped to algebraic models that will be studied in later grades. Students are introduced to the
Polish notation as a different way of communicating operations. Our problem sets are designed to avoid
mechanical execution of computational algorithms on the student’s part.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Simpson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled Practice Operations: Level 1 (ages 7 to 9) (Competitive
Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume 3). Try to stumble through book Practice Operations: Level 1
(ages 7 to 9) (Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume 3) as your friend. It means that it can
being your friend when you experience alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than in the
past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience and knowledge with this
book.

Roberta Swinton:

The book Practice Operations: Level 1 (ages 7 to 9) (Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume
3) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a good
thing like a book Practice Operations: Level 1 (ages 7 to 9) (Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students)
(Volume 3)? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that will book can give many
data for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you
take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Practice Operations: Level
1 (ages 7 to 9) (Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume 3) has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by open up and read a e-book.
So it is very wonderful.

Isidro Wells:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Practice Operations: Level 1 (ages 7 to 9)
(Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume 3), you may enjoy both. It is great combination
right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout fellas.
What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Faye Michaels:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you



knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something
by book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra Practice
Operations: Level 1 (ages 7 to 9) (Competitive Mathematics for Gifted Students) (Volume 3).
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