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Self-organized criticality, the spontaneous development of systems to a critical state, is the first general
theory of complex systems with a firm mathematical basis. This theory describes how many seemingly
desperate aspects of the world, from stock market crashes to mass extinctions, avalanches to solar flares, all
share a set of simple, easily described properties. " . . . a 'must read' . . . Bak writes with such ease and
lucidity, and his ideas are so intriguing . . . essential reading for those interested in complex systems . . . it
will reward a sufficiently skeptical reader" -NATURE " . . . presents the theory (self-organized criticality) in
a form easily absorbed by the non-mathematically inclined reader" -BOSTON BOOK REVIEW "I picture
Bak as a kind of scientific musketeer; flamboyant, touchy, full of swagger and ready to join every fray . . .
His book is written with panache. The style is brisk, the content stimulating. I recommend it as a bracing
experience" -NEW SCIENTIST
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From reader reviews:

Michael Pauls:

In other case, little persons like to read book How Nature Works: the science of self-organized criticality.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any
book How Nature Works: the science of self-organized criticality. You can add information and of course
you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple issue until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, you can open a book or even searching by internet system. It
is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's go through.

Ashley Washington:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this How Nature Works: the science of self-
organized criticality book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Cheri Turner:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the How Nature Works: the science of
self-organized criticality is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Sam Nielsen:

This How Nature Works: the science of self-organized criticality is new way for you who has curiosity to
look for some information given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you into it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this How Nature Works: the
science of self-organized criticality can be the light food for you because the information inside this kind of
book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by
anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel
drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a guide especially this one. You
can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-
book sort for your better life and also knowledge.
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