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What are the essentials of screenplay structure? What's the difference between plot, story, and theme? What's
the best camera angle to convey inner psychology? How are movie finances structured?

These questions and more are answered in this exquisitely packaged book by Neil Landau, an experienced
screenwriter and script consultant to the major movie studios. Presented in the familiar format of the popular
101 THINGS I LEARNED® book series, 101 THINGS I LEARNED IN FILM SCHOOL's two-page,
illustrated lessons will engage, inform, and inspire film school students, amateur filmmakers, high school
grads, industry professionals, and casual aficionados.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Hickox:

Often the book 101 Things I Learned in Film School will bring someone to the new experience of reading a
new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book you just read, this
book very acceptable to you. The book 101 Things I Learned in Film School is much recommended to you to
read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Judith Carter:

The book 101 Things I Learned in Film School has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. This articles author makes
some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
perusing this book.

Richard Oneal:

The book untitled 101 Things I Learned in Film School contain a lot of information on the item. The writer
explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so
do not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author brings you
in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can continue reading your
smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book,
you can available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.

Frances McKay:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This 101 Things I Learned in Film
School can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending your
free time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the
others?
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