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New York Times bestselling author Lori Foster captivated readers with her stories of love, justice and
danger in the Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor series. Now, fan-favorite Chris Chapey gets his own
story!

When the going gets tough, the tough turn to Chris Chapey. As the right-hand man to a group of take-no-
prisoners mercenaries, Chris can organize a top-secret rescue mission with his eyes closed. But when it
comes to his personal life, Chris is the one who needs a little help.

His problem: Matt Houser. Chris can't deny his attraction to Matt, but Matt has no idea what Chris's job
really entails and how much it means to him. Matt challenges Chris to change his life—and make a place for
him in it. Can Chris risk telling him the truth?

Look for more titles in the Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor series, available now from Lori Foster
and Harlequin HQN: A Perfect Storm, Savor the Danger, Trace of Fever and When You Dare.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Swafford:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around
the world. Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide What Chris Wants (The Men Who
Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) will make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if
you can know about anything. But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or
appropriate book with you?

Thomas Hayden:

This What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) book is not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information
inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This particular What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5)
without we realize teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
possibly be worry What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) can bring once you
are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it within your
lovely laptop even telephone. This What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5)
having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Jacqueline Harding:

Typically the book What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) will bring you to
definitely the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very
unique. If you try to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book What Chris
Wants (The Men Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Nancy Maxfield:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping What Chris Wants (The Men
Who Walk the Edge of Honor Book 5) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this
book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only
for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all you who
want to start reading as your good habit, it is possible to pick What Chris Wants (The Men Who Walk the
Edge of Honor Book 5) become your personal starter.
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