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The title poem, inspired by Philip Levine’s “They Feed They Lions,” explores where poetry comes from,
what the influences are, and how to nourish one’s poems. The rest of the book illustrates that the stories,
sensory images and “flights of imagination” needed to create worthy poems are in our relationships, in our
dreams, in the world around us. They are in the backyard where ordinary birds live, love and die, and where
earthworms swim for their lives after a soaking rain; in a woman's memories of her deceased brother, and a
child’s horrific visions sparked by an overheard conversation, in an encounter with Jehovah’s Witnesses and
observations of Catholic mass. There are the homeless on the streets and in the park; and ordinary people
coping with life-altering chronic illness. There is the lonely death of a parent, the impending death of a
beloved pet and the difficult birth of a first child. There are the realities of modern life: identity theft, Bernie
Madoff, our eroding environment. And there is Lois Lane pining for Superman and the Little Mermaid living
a life very different from the one her father wants for her. These are only a smattering of what They Feed
Their Poems offers, not the least of which, are the many lovely illustrations.
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From reader reviews:

Kurtis Henry:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled They Feed Their Poems. Try to make book They Feed Their Poems as
your pal. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with
course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far
more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

Sandy Gonsalves:

This They Feed Their Poems tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person,
why. The reason why of this They Feed Their Poems can be one of several great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with information that maybe
will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever
your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this They Feed Their Poems forcing you to
have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it
useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Federico Crouch:

The book with title They Feed Their Poems includes a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a
lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the
world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book
on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Charlene Johnson:

Many people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt it when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose often the book They Feed Their Poems to make your current
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the idea about book and reading through especially. It is
to be initial opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the guide They Feed Their Poems
can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information must you're
doing of these time.
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