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The Abingdon New Testament Commentaries series provides compact, critical commentaries on the writings
of the New Testament. These commentaries are written with special attention to the needs and interests of
theological students, but they will also be useful for students in upper-level college or university settings, as
well as for pastors and other religious leaders. In addition to providing basic information about the New
Testament texts and insights into their meanings, these commentaries are intended to exemplify the tasks and
procedures of careful, critical biblical exegesis.

In this volume, Donald Senior unfolds the meaning of Matthew’s Gospel in its original context. The Gospel
was written for an early Christian community caught in a moment of profound transition, striving to remain
faithful to its Jewish heritage and facing a new and uncertain future in the Gentile world. Building on a
lifetime of scholarship on this Gospel, Senior uses an array of methodologies to explore the literary,
historical, and theological perspectives of Matthew in context. At the same time, he provides leads for the
contemporary reader to note the interplay between Matthew’s Gospel and our own time and place. In the
nexus between these two worlds of experiences, the message of the Gospel comes alive and takes on new
meaning.
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From reader reviews:

Lena Stubbs:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Abingdon New Testament Commentaries: Matthew. Try to
the actual book Abingdon New Testament Commentaries: Matthew as your buddy. It means that it can to
become your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than in the past.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know every
little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Gregory Eubanks:

Abingdon New Testament Commentaries: Matthew can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The
copy writer giving his/her effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing Abingdon New Testament
Commentaries: Matthew although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest as well as based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Gordon Lipsky:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Abingdon New Testament
Commentaries: Matthew guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may
be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every ideas
and composing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt Abingdon New Testament
Commentaries: Matthew as good book but not only by the cover but also by content. This is one book that
can break don't evaluate book by its include, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh
come on your reading through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.

Michael Grammer:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Abingdon New Testament Commentaries:
Matthew to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading skill is developing when you
such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about
book and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and examine
it. Beside that the reserve Abingdon New Testament Commentaries: Matthew can to be your new friend
when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.
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