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This collection of cartoons, quips, quotes, and insights introduces a new comedy genre: elderhumor. It
captures the wry hilarity of our real-life sitcoms. Generational vocabulary gaps, miscommunications,
preoccupation with health and comforts, foibles, disguises (for aging), even physical limitations -- all can
have their funny sides when we're laughing at ourselves. This book, a light-hearted gift for anyone who's 50-
plus, is a memoryjogger too. Remember the Katzenjammer Kids? Jack Armstrong? Apple Mary? Check out
your friends' ages by their responses to a "Vanishing Words" test (examples: "spider," "broomstick skirt,"
"running board," "the shag"). If you're still calling the refrigerator an "icebox," it's a giveaway -- you're
probably over 60. What's So Funny about Getting Old? is brought to you by a comedy team of two. Ed
Fischer is an award-winning cartoonist. Jane Thomas Noland, author of Laugh It Off (what's so funny about
trying to lose weight?) is a books editor and a former Minneapolis Star Tribune feature writer. Both have
delicious ways of looking at life. Both, like all the rest of us, are getting older. Laughter heals. Laughter
helps. Laughter keeps us in shape emotionally and physically. Read this book and try it. You'll be convinced,
as these authors are, that there's only one way to grow older -- with a healthy sense of humor!
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From reader reviews:

Della Richardson:

The knowledge that you get from 2 Books/ What's so Funny About Getting Old? & You're No Spring
Chicken (Laughter for the young at heart) will be the more deep you looking the information that hide in the
words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but 2
Books/ What's so Funny About Getting Old? & You're No Spring Chicken (Laughter for the young at heart)
giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood
by means of anyone who read the idea because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. That book
also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go with you, both
in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this kind of 2 Books/ What's so Funny
About Getting Old? & You're No Spring Chicken (Laughter for the young at heart) instantly.

Celia Norton:

The reserve with title 2 Books/ What's so Funny About Getting Old? & You're No Spring Chicken (Laughter
for the young at heart) has lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of benefit after read
this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this e-book represented the
condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world.
This book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so
you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Johnny Relyea:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you
can read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent
24 hours a day to reading a reserve. The book 2 Books/ What's so Funny About Getting Old? & You're No
Spring Chicken (Laughter for the young at heart) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of folks
that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book out of your smart
phone. The price is not very costly but this book offers high quality.

Jimmy Miller:

You can obtain this 2 Books/ What's so Funny About Getting Old? & You're No Spring Chicken (Laughter
for the young at heart) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve
problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply
written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era such as now,
you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to



get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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