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The decision to quit smoking is far from a casual one. Quitting smoking involves your complete
commitment; it must become your number-one priority. Mustering all the support you can get, you need to
decide to turn up the flame on your survival instincts, your belief in a healthy future, and your will power
and faith that you can and will quit. The sooner you stop smoking, the better your chances of avoiding some
of the unwelcome consequences of smoking. You body and brain begin to recover almost immediately.
Cigarette cravings aside, your body wants to stop smoking, and the moment you cut loose the smokes, your
respiratory system begins to clear itself out.Here are just a few of the benefits you can reap from kicking the
habit: a longer life with a lower risk of cancer and other deadly diseases; no more sore throats, congested
lungs, and persistent cough; the ability to exercise and 'get back into shape'; Kissable breath and clothes that
don't smell like you just came home from a bar; being able to really taste good food; pleasing your family
and friends and no more being the outcast. Like all smokers, you've probably tried to quit a half dozen times,
only to relapse. Perhaps you'd given up all hope of being able to quit, but now you're getting pressure from
others, such as family members, to end your smoking career completely. But how do you take those first
steps? And how do you follow through with your commitment to quit smoking? "Quitting Smoking For
Dummies" can help."Quitting Smoking For Dummies" takes a total approach to help you quit smoking -
short of yanking the cigarettes from your hands. It gives you the cold, hard truth about why you're addicted
and how smoking harms your body - and it helps you develop a plan for finally quitting. Here's just a
sampling of the topics you'll find covered: understanding the various forms of tobacco - and their effects;
figuring out why you're addicted; analyzing the health risks of smoking; developing a strategy to quit
smoking; exploring nicotine replacement therapies; staying clean: avoiding the relapse; getting help from
support groups and programs; and special considerations for pregnancy and teen smoking. So, the question to
ask yourself is, "Why wait to quit?" You're going to have to eventually; why not start now? "With Quitting
Smoking For Dummies", you can start your recovery today, and look forward to a long and healthy life.
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From reader reviews:

Dennis Boone:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Quitting Smoking For Dummies is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Jeremy Smith:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Quitting Smoking For Dummies, you may enjoy
both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come
on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Edgar Foley:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking Quitting Smoking For Dummies that give
your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be
said as the opportunity for people to know world much better then how they react when it comes to the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading practice only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants
to be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you are able to pick
Quitting Smoking For Dummies become your own personal starter.

Darron Hiller:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be Quitting Smoking For Dummies why because the
great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to
pick up this book.
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