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Excerpt from What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the Business and Literary World

In the State of Massachusetts, which was the scene of Miss Martineau's reputed observation, it is now
announced that there are two hundred and eighty-four occupations open to women, instead of seven, and that
251,158 women are earning their own living in these occupations, receiving from $150 to $3,000 every year.
This computation does not include amateurs, or mothers and daughters in the household, and of course
excludes domestic service.

As new occupations for women are continually becoming available, some well known professions are
omitted from this volume to make room for newer and more responsible ones. The writer has endeavored to
illustrate tho many employments given, by facts and curious incidents gathered from various sources and
from personal observation, thus making the work peculiarly interesting, instructive, and amusing.

In "Women as Poets," will be found some of the rarest and choicest poems in the English language, and in
many instances the biographical note was contributed especially for this volume by the author of the poem
selected, thus furnishing much reliable information not to be found elsewhere. So many pure and beautiful
thoughts in rhyme, which have echoed and re-echoed throughout the world, making it better for their being,
must add to the value of the book. The kingdom of home has not been overlooked; the aim of the writer-
indeed the great object of the work-is to elevate and glorify the humblest home, and it is her earnest wish that
"What Can a Woman Do" may be found a welcome visitor into every home in the land, there to accomplish
its mission of usefulness and instruction.

About the Publisher

Forgotten Books publishes hundreds of thousands of rare and classic books. Find more at
www.forgottenbooks.com
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Lyon:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is definitely What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the Business and Literary World (Classic
Reprint).

James Stumbaugh:

The book untitled What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the Business and Literary World (Classic
Reprint) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language
is very clear to see all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled
by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book
because you can please read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere
and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site in
addition to order it. Have a nice go through.

Carolyn Treece:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the Business
and Literary World (Classic Reprint) was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that
book What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the Business and Literary World (Classic Reprint) has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read
and think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you
feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading in which.

Joseph Whitely:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in the
Business and Literary World (Classic Reprint) to make your own reading is interesting. Your own skill of
reading ability is developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy
to learn it and mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like
to available a book and examine it. Beside that the publication What Can a Woman Do: Or Her Position in
the Business and Literary World (Classic Reprint) can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel
alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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