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“I’m a person who listens for a living.  I listen for wisdom, and beauty, and for voices not shouting to
be heard.  This book chronicles some of what I’ve learned in what has become a conversation across
time and generations, across disciplines and denominations.”
 
Peabody Award-winning broadcaster and National Humanities Medalist Krista Tippett has interviewed the
most extraordinary voices examining the great questions of meaning for our time. The heart of her work on
her national public radio program and podcast, On Being, has been to shine a light on people whose insights
kindle in us a sense of wonder and courage. Scientists in a variety of fields; theologians from an array of
faiths; poets, activists, and many others have all opened themselves up to Tippett's compassionate yet
searching conversation.
 
In Becoming Wise, Tippett distills the insights she has gleaned from this luminous conversation in its many
dimensions into a coherent narrative journey, over time and from mind to mind. The book is a master class in
living, curated by Tippett and accompanied by a delightfully ecumenical dream team of teaching faculty. 
 
The open questions and challenges of our time are intimate and civilizational all at once, Tippett says –
definitions of when life begins and when death happens, of the meaning of community and family and
identity, of our relationships to technology and through technology. The wisdom we seek emerges through
the raw materials of the everyday. And the enduring question of what it means to be human has now become
inextricable from the question of who we are to each other. 
 
This book offers a grounded and fiercely hopeful vision of humanity for this century – of personal growth
but also renewed public life and human spiritual evolution. It insists on the possibility of a common life for
this century marked by resilience and redemption, with beauty as a core moral value and civility and love as
muscular practice. Krista Tippett's great gift, in her work and inBecoming Wise, is to avoid reductive
simplifications but still find the golden threads that weave people and ideas together into a shimmering braid.
 
One powerful common denominator of the lessons imparted to Tippett is the gift of presence, of the
exhilaration of engagement with life for its own sake, not as a means to an end. But presence does not mean
passivity or acceptance of the status quo. Indeed Tippett and her teachers are people whose work meets, and
often drives, powerful forces of change alive in the world today. In the end, perhaps the greatest blessing
conveyed by the lessons of spiritual genius Tippett harvests in Becoming Wise is the strength to meet the
world where it really is, and then to make it better.
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From reader reviews:

Linnie Martinez:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for us. The book Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living
seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is
extremely advantages for you. The e-book Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living is
not only giving you considerably more new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored. You
can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with all the book
Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living. You never really feel lose out for everything
in the event you read some books.

Cheri Whaley:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of
Living was multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Becoming Wise:
An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living has many kinds or style. Start from kids until young adults.
For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you are the character on there.
So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that will.

Judith Roemer:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By the book
Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living we can acquire more advantage. Don't that
you be creative people? For being creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book
that ideal with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Becoming Wise: An
Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living. You can more appealing than now.

Robert Russo:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
Becoming Wise: An Inquiry into the Mystery and Art of Living when you needed it?
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