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For more than three decades, Walt "Baby" Love has touched the lives of more than ten million listeners
across the world. Every week he shares his triumphs, challenges, and soul-stirring moments through his
award-winning radio programs. He has built a following of millions of listeners and repeatedly shattered
racial barriers as a black man in an industry long dominated by whites. Yet this former army paratrooper
with the famed 82nd Airborne Division, who served in Southeast Asia, also broke ground as a man of
disciplined, abiding faith who refused to bow to corrupt influences.

His enormously popular syndicated rhythm-and-blues show lost its spot on a Chicago radio station because
Walt would not refrain from counseling his listeners to look to Jesus. Though beloved by his devoted
listeners, Walt was often treated as an outcast by other African-American broadcasters and industry
executives because of his outspoken and steadfast devotion to the Christian way of life.

Still, both earthly and heavenly rewards have come in great abundance to the man raised by his great-
grandparents in rural Pennsylvania. In The Gospel According to Rev. Walt "Baby" Love he offers reflections
and inspirational thoughts drawn from his life. He shares how his religious convictions helped him survive
and thrive in an industry he believed to be rife with corruption and ungodly influences. And he recounts the
story of his progression of faith from a player of gospel and R&B music to an ordained minister and preacher
of God's Word.
Each chapter focuses on a Bible verse, reflecting on its significance to him and guiding you on how to
incorporate its teachings into your own daily life. An uplifting story of faith, family, and forgiveness in the
face of God's plan, The Gospel According to Rev. Walt "Baby" Love is inspirational reading at its best.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Ahlstrom:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important usually. The book The Gospel According to Rev. Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations
and Meditations from the Gospel Radio Legend was making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The book The Gospel
According to Rev. Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations and Meditations from the Gospel Radio Legend is not only
giving you much more new information but also to be your friend when you experience bored. You can
spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with the book The Gospel According to
Rev. Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations and Meditations from the Gospel Radio Legend. You never sense lose
out for everything should you read some books.

Curtis Tyson:

Typically the book The Gospel According to Rev. Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations and Meditations from the
Gospel Radio Legend has a lot associated with on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a
lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some research before write
this book. This particular book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Victor Havens:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This The Gospel According to Rev.
Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations and Meditations from the Gospel Radio Legend is simple to create you can
read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring typically the
printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart
phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Teresa Randall:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Gospel According to Rev. Walt 'Baby' Love: Inspirations and
Meditations from the Gospel Radio Legend can make you experience more interested to read.
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