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Food has the power to temporarily alleviate stress and sadness, enhance joy, and bring us comfort when we
need it most. It's no wonder experts estimate that 75 percent of overeating is triggered by our emotions, not
physical hunger. The good news is you can instead soothe yourself through dozens of mindful activities that
are healthy for both body and mind.

Susan Albers, author of Eating Mindfully, now offers 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself Without Food, a
collection of mindfulness skills and practices for relaxing the body in times of stress and ending your
dependence on eating as a means of coping with difficult emotions. You'll not only discover easy ways to
soothe urges to overeat, you'll also learn how to differentiate emotion-driven hunger from healthy hunger.
Reach for this book instead of the refrigerator next time you feel the urge to snack-these alternatives are just
as satisfying!
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From reader reviews:

Rose Villegas:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book allowed 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself
Without Food? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time together
with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have some other
opinion?

William Ullrich:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself
Without Food that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading
behavior all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world better then how they react to the
world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit, you
could pick 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself Without Food become your starter.

Felecia Holst:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself Without
Food reserve written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by
anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for
eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself Without Food as good
book not just by the cover but also from the content. This is one publication that can break don't determine
book by its cover, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your looking at
sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Deanne Mohammed:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This 50 Ways to Soothe Yourself Without
Food can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your
time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than
the others?
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