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Roy ('Backpack') Baron earned his nickname, ‘Backpack‘, when he hit the pause on his Executive career
consulting Fortune 100 firms and U.S. Government Agencies in cutting edge Computer Science, Information
Technology, encryption, and Cyber-Security. He escaped the comfortable cozy corporate cubicle cocoon and
crisscrossed America making for adventure, on a life-enriching sabbatical.

Backpack yearned for adventure and sold/donated his worldly goods, put minimal possessions in a backpack
and hit the road to experience America.

From a plush office to the back roads of America. Backpack had the guts to hang-up a lucrative secure
corporate career and experience life' Said Yoda, Editor of the Magnified View Magazine. ' He took risks that
few dare to do and was rewarded with enriching experiences.He met with the rich and famous and the poor
and homeless.

While on a group wilderness 110 degree Grand Canyon Canyon expedition Backpack was bitten by a Black
Widow spider resulting in losing a hunk of his left leg calf in an emergency room in Flagstaff Arizona. He
nearly fell off a raggedy ladder at his covert mission in the Indian reservation Hava Supai in the Grand
Canyon.

Hear more about Backpack's argosy in America on his popular radio program, Voices of Global Freedom.

Roy is an award-winning journalist, distinguished author of his diary called “Looking Glass Shattered“, host
and producer of the popular “Voices of Global Freedom Radio” show and a rough and tumble adventurer.

“Backpack packs a lot into life and writes exclusive, riveting, feature articles for our magazine.” Said
Janorama, Founding Editor In Chief of the million plus visitors Magnified View Magazine.

Backpack traveled by train, plane, bus, bike, hitchhiking, and on foot. He interviewed well to do, the blue
collar and befriended the downtrodden homeless. He lived in four star hotels, ghettos, hotels, campsites,
hostels, homeless shelters, and with families.

Adventure means risk and uncertain outcomes. Backpack’s journal “Looking Glass Shattered: Questions and
Answers that Heal Old Wounds” reveals close calls he encountered on his journey, including armed robbers,
assaults, hypothermia, and toxic water on wilderness trails.

Backpack’s street savvy skills helped him dodge very dangerous and conniving bad guys. He learned the
hard way that an over abundance of altruistic My Human Compassion can lead to victimization.

Highlights of Backpack’s journey was hiking over one-hundred miles through the Appalachian Trail from
Georgia to Maine. He was drawn to the world’s longest marked-path trail to escape the hectic city life, meet
other kindred woodsmen, and reconnect with nature.



He gave mountains of clothing to distressed victims of hurricane Ilene in Stowe Vermont, and gathered
undercover intelligence on the hapless Occupy Movement in Manhattan New Yortk City, Eugene Oregon,
Tent City in Phoenix Arizona, and on a convert investigative journalist mission across the Texas Rio Grande
to Boquillos Mexico.

Radio interviewing fascinating people in unique places from a popup tent trailer. He has stand up interviews
of park rangers in Yellowstone National Park, financial executives on Wall Street, Cajuns in Louisiana
swamps, housewives in rural Nebraska, Fortune 100 corporate Barons in a Skyscraper Chicago, a prospector
in the superstition mountains of Arizona, drugged out New Age hippies in San Francisco, and Black Panthers
in Oakland California.

As a people magnet, Backpack met some fond life-long friends on his journey.

“Roy our News Editor makes major contributions to Magnified View’s Magazine ‘analysis of News you can
use’ and provides ‘actionable tactics, methods, and strategies to survive and thrive in these dangerous
troubled times.” observed Janorama, Magnified View’s Editor-In-Chief. “Roy recounts his life-enriching
adventure crafting feature articles for million plus circulated Magnified View Internet magazine.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Watkins:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle Commando to
Constitutional Conservative Leader. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important any book Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle Commando to
Constitutional Conservative Leader. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a
book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your country right up until
foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this
era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to use it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Jo Melvin:

The book Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle Commando to Constitutional Conservative Leader can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we
leave a good thing like a book Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle Commando to Constitutional Conservative
Leader? Some of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give many
information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or
details that you take for that, you could give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Looking Glass
Shattered: Cubicle Commando to Constitutional Conservative Leader has simple shape but the truth is know:
it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a publication. So
it is very wonderful.

Carl Brinkley:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle
Commando to Constitutional Conservative Leader, you could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you
still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't
get it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Raymond Augustus:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide
that need more time to be examine. Looking Glass Shattered: Cubicle Commando to Constitutional
Conservative Leader can be your answer because it can be read by a person who have those short time



problems.
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