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LEGO bricks are the building blocks of childhood. Yet they are far from child's play. LEGO sets are fast
becoming a hot commodity with collectors worldwide for fun and profit.

Abundantly visual, informative and detailed, The Ultimate Guide to Collectible LEGO Sets is the definitive
reference to more than 2,000 of the most collectible sets on the secondary market, illustrating the incredible
value of LEGO bricks, not only from an entertainment and educational standpoint, but also as an investment.
Consider a Star Wars Ultimate Collector Series Millennium Falcon, which sold at retail for $500, is now
selling for more than $3,500 on the secondary market.

The Ultimate Guide to Collectible LEGO Sets features:

More than 25 top themes, including Advanced Models, Batman, Ideas/Cuusoo, Star Wars UCS and non-●

UCS sets, Technic, Trains, and Vintage
Up-to-date secondary market prices for more than 2,000 new and used sets from 2000 to present●

More than 300 full-color photos of sets in their boxes, and built models●

Tips on reselling, flipping, and investing●

The Ultimate Guide to Collectible LEGO Sets is your brick-by-brick guide to a world of imagination and
discovery.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Garcia:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book called The Ultimate Guide
to Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and Price Guide? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
understand beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree
with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Ismael Soliz:

The book untitled The Ultimate Guide to Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and Price Guide is the
guide that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a
lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of The Ultimate Guide to Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and
Price Guide from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Quentin Taylor:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not striving The Ultimate Guide to
Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and Price Guide that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for
people to know world far better then how they react towards the world. It can't be claimed constantly that
reading practice only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So ,
for all you who want to start reading through as your good habit, it is possible to pick The Ultimate Guide to
Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and Price Guide become your own starter.

Veda Howard:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or even make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful pics on
there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this time, many
ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this The Ultimate
Guide to Collectible LEGO® Sets: Identification and Price Guide can make you experience more interested
to read.
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