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The groundbreaking, award-winning investigation into Lyme disease?the science, history, medical
politics, and patient experience?now with a brand new chapter.

When Pamela Weintraub, a science journalist, learned that her oldest son tested positive for Lyme disease,
she thought she had found an answer to the symptoms that had been plaguing her family for years?but her
nightmare had just begun. Almost everything about Lyme disease turned out to be deeply controversial, from
the microbe causing the infection, to the length and type of treatment and the kind of practitioner needed.

On one side of the fight, the scientists who first studied Lyme describe a disease transmitted by a deer tick
that is hard to catch but easy to cure no matter how advanced the case. On the other side, rebel doctors insist
that Lyme and a soup of "co-infections" cause a complicated spectrum of illness often dramatically different
– and far more difficult to treat – than the original researchers claim. Instead of just swollen knees and a rash,
patients can experience exhaustion, disabling pain, and a "Lyme fog" that leaves them dazed and confused.
As patients struggle for answers, once-treatable infections become chronic.
In this nuanced picture of the intense controversy and crippling uncertainty surrounding Lyme disease,
Pamela Weintraub sheds light on one of the angriest medical disputes raging today. The most comprehensive
book ever written about the past, present and future of Lyme disease, Cure Unknown exposes the ticking
clock of a raging epidemic and the vulnerability we all share.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Skeens:

This Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is
in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book
incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic without we know teach the one who studying it become critical
in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic can bring if you
are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely laptop
even mobile phone. This Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic having excellent arrangement in word
and also layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Ruth Haakenson:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want sense happy read
one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme
Epidemic is kind of book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Neil Myers:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You can
observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you
personally is Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic this publication consist a lot of the information in
the condition of this world now. This book was represented how does the world has grown up. The dialect
styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when
he makes this book. That is why this book suited all of you.

James Haney:

That publication can make you to feel relax. That book Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme Epidemic was
colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Cure Unknown: Inside the Lyme
Epidemic has many kinds or category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book to
suit your needs and try to like reading in which.
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